
 

 

 SHARABLE 
Chicken Wings $12 (Hot, suicide, teriyaki, honey garlic, BBQ, salt & pepper, lemon pepper, 
roasted garlic, sriracha lime, chipotle mango, and thai). Bucket o' Fries $5 Side of gravy $2 (gluten 
free) Buffalo Chicken Wontons $10 (blue cheese dressing) Truffle Mac & Cheese Balls $12 (spicy 
marinara & parmesan) Deep Fried Dumplings $12 (wasabi) Tri-Coloured Nachos $15 (Mozzarella 
cheese, cheddar cheese, olives, green onion, tomato, jalapeños, served with sour cream & salsa) 
*Add $2.50 for chicken or beef Charcuterie Board $20 An assortment of meats & cheese to share 
*may vary upon seasons Taco Trio $16 (3 tacos - tuna, shrimp, & fried fish, served with coleslaw, 
lettuce, tomato, cheddar cheese & salsa). Classic Poutine $13 Turkey Dinner Poutine $13 (with 
turkey, stuffing & topped with cranberry sauce). Taco Poutine $13 (diced tomatoes, sour cream 
and chives) 

 

CEDAR'S HAND HELDS 
**All burgers are 7oz ground chuck patties. **All hand helds are served with your choice of fries, tossed 
salad or crispy mashed potatoes (potatoes served with sour cream, bacon & chives) **Gluten free 
hamburger buns available  

 

Round-About-Beef Dip $16 (Thinly sliced rib eye with horseradish. Served with inion rings. 
Rueben Dog $12 (Corn beef wiener, topped with swiss cheese, sauerkraut, banana peppers, 
drizzled with Dijon mustard). Chilli Dog $12 The Foothills Burger $17 (Topped with mustard, 
ketchup & onions). Cedar's Burger $17 (Topped with garlic aioli, jalapeños, swiss cheese lettuce, 
tomato & onion). The Barn Burner $16 (Topped with Sriracha aioli, jalapeños, swiss cheese, 
lettuce, tomato & onion). The Royal Burger $20 (7oz blue elk patty with blueberries, topped with 
brie cheese, blueberry aioli, lettuce, tomato & onion). The Beyond Meat Burger $15 (Veggie patty, 
garlic aioli, lettuce, tomato & onion). Thai Chicken Wrap $16 (Thai sauce, steamed noodles, grilled 
chicken, onions, mushrooms & green pepper). Pulled Turkey Sandwich $14 (Served with 
cranberries & coleslaw) Chicken Club Sandwich $14 (Grilled chicken breast, topped with cheddar, 
bacon, lettuce & tomato) Note: Extra toppings $1.50 each: bacon, fried egg, mushrooms, sautéed 
onions, guacamole, smoked cheddar, jalapeños, cheddar or pizza toppings. 

 

CEDAR'S THIN CRUST PIZZA 
**Gluten free crust available  

 

The Limestone $16 (Tomato sauce, basil, fresh ricotta cheese, prosciutto & truffle oil). The Ya Ha 
$17 (Tomato sauce, crumbled meatballs, sweet bell peppers, kalamata olive & artichokes). The 
Sawmill $17 (Garlic butter, sliced baby potatoes, crisp bacon, sour cream & chives). The Pioneer 
$18 (Meatballs, peppered bacon, sausage, ham & pepperoni). The Smoky Pig $18 (Slow roasted 
BBQ pork, grilled pineapple, caramelized onions & hot peppers). The Cheery Bomb $16 (Tomato 
sauce, bocconcini, cheery tomatoes, drizzled with a balsamic reduction & basil). The Rodeo $19 
(Garlic butter, kalamata olives, sautéed spinach, red onion, roasted garlic, fire roasted peppers, 
feta cheese, drizzled with truffle oil). The Big Pickle $16 (Sour cream & dill base. Topped with 
cheese and pickles. Oil can be substituted for the sour cream upon request). 

 
 
 



 

MAIN PLANKS 

 

 
7oz Sirloin Steak Sandwich 

Topped with sautéed onion & mushrooms, served with veggies & your choice of potato. $16 
 
 

 
3 piece Chicken Dinner 

Served with fries & coleslaw $12 
 
 

 
Fish 'N Chips $15 

 
 

CEDAR'S GARDEN 
Lettuce Wedge $14 (Iceberg wedge topped with bacon, tomato, blue cheese dressing & sprinkled 
with green onion). Garden Salad $12 (Mixed greens topped with tomato, cucumber, onion, sweet 
bell peppers, broccoli & topped off with cheddar cheese. Your choice of dressing). Greek Salad 
$16 (Homemade Greek dressing!) Tuna Salad $17 (Mixed greens topped with seasoned tuna 
(rare), avocado, sweet bell peppers, cucumbers & drizzled with our wasabi sauce dressing). 
Caesar Salad $13 Teriyaki Cashew Caesar Salad $16 (Chicken and cashews in teriyaki sauce 
on a caesar salad). Cedar's Firey Chicken Salad $16 (Cajun chicken, mixed greens, corn, pine 
nuts, cranberries & onions tossed in a citrus dressing). 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
 

 
 


